



BID TABULATION

Bid Number: ITB 17-5  
 Bid Title: Ocala Main Campus Site  
 Lighting Upgrades  
 Opening Date: Wednesday, June 7, 2017  
 Time of Opening: 2:15 PM

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

Opened by: Stewart E. Trautman, Director of Purchasing  
 Recorded by: Pamela Halsey, Staff Assistant IV

VENDOR NAME	Anixter	BESCO Electric Supply Co.	City Electric Supply	Rexel
ADDRESS	1602 NE 6th Ave Ocala, FL 3447	711 South 14th Street Leesburg, FL 34749-1366	2730 SW 3rd Place Ocala, FL 34471	1406 SW 15th Avenue Ocala, FL 34471
CONTACT PERSON	Carrie Crews	Matt King	Jeremy Brosius	Terri Reese
TELEPHONE	352.732.2995	352.787.4542	352.237.8088	352.368.7952
FAX NUMBER				

1				2			3			4		
Item Description	Qty	Unit Price	Total Cost	Qty	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Qty	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Qty	Unit Cost	Total Cost
1 Philips - Gardco	154	\$ 937.00	\$ 144,298.00	154	\$ 985.00	\$ 151,690	154	\$ 973.94	\$ 149,986.76	154	\$ 980.00	\$ 150,920
2 Philips - Gardco	3	\$ 937.00	\$ 2,811.00	3	\$ 985.00	\$ 2,955	3	\$ 973.94	\$ 2,921.82	3	\$ 980.00	\$ 2,940
3 Philips - Gardco	1	\$ 937.00	\$ 937.00	1	\$ 985.00	\$ 985	1	\$ 973.94	\$ 973.94	1	\$ 980.00	\$ 980
4 Visionaire	64	\$ 909.00	\$ 58,176.00	64	\$ 960.00	\$ 61,440	64	\$ 947.03	\$ 60,609.92	64	\$ 953.00	\$ 60,992
5 Visionaire	87	\$ 909.00	\$ 79,083.00	87	\$ 960.00	\$ 83,520	87	\$ 947.03	\$ 82,391.61	87	\$ 953.00	\$ 82,911
6 Visionaire	5	\$ 909.00	\$ 4,545.00	5	\$ 960.00	\$ 4,800	5	\$ 947.03	\$ 4,735.15	5	\$ 953.00	\$ 4,765
7 TOTAL			\$ 289,850.00			\$ 305,390			\$ 301,614.20			\$ 303,508

SUBMITTALS				SUBMITTALS				SUBMITTALS				SUBMITTALS			
Solicitation, Offer and Award	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Solicitation, Offer and Award	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Solicitation, Offer and Award	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Solicitation, Offer and Award	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
Bid/Offer Response Form	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Bid/Offer Response Form	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Bid/Offer Response Form	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Bid/Offer Response Form	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
Drug Free Workforce Cert.	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Drug Free Workforce Cert.	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Drug Free Workforce Cert.	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Drug Free Workforce Cert.	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
Affidavit of Compliance	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Affidavit of Compliance	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Affidavit of Compliance	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Affidavit of Compliance	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
Statement of No Bid	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Statement of No Bid	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Statement of No Bid	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Statement of No Bid	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
ADDENDUM NO. 1	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 1	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 1	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 1	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
ADDENDUM NO. 2	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 2	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 2	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 2	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
ADDENDUM NO. 3	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 3	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 3	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 3	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	

Signature: \_\_\_\_\_ Bid Opening Official \_\_\_\_\_ Date \_\_\_\_\_ Bid Recorder \_\_\_\_\_ Date \_\_\_\_\_



BID TABULATION

Bid Number: ITB 17-5  
 Bid Title: Ocala Main Campus Site  
 Lighting Upgrades  
 Opening Date: Wednesday, June 7, 2017  
 Time of Opening: 2:15 PM

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

Opened by: Stewart E. Trautman, Director of Purchasing  
 Recorded by: Pamela Halsey, Staff Assistant IV

VENDOR NAME	Grainger
ADDRESS	1657 Shermer Northbrook, IL 60062
CONTACT PERSON	Rebecca Carity
TELEPHONE	847.753.5364
FAX NUMBER	NO BID / Late

5				6			7			8		
Item Description	Qty	Unit Price	Total Cost	Qty	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Qty	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Qty	Unit Cost	Total Cost
1 Philips - Gardco	154	\$ _____	\$ _____	154	\$ _____	\$ _____	154	\$ _____	\$ _____	154	\$ _____	\$ _____
2 Philips - Gardco	3	\$ _____	\$ _____	3	\$ _____	\$ _____	3	\$ _____	\$ _____	3	\$ _____	\$ _____
3 Philips - Gardco	1	\$ _____	\$ _____	1	\$ _____	\$ _____	1	\$ _____	\$ _____	1	\$ _____	\$ _____
4 Visionaire	64	\$ _____	\$ _____	64	\$ _____	\$ _____	64	\$ _____	\$ _____	64	\$ _____	\$ _____
5 Visionaire	87	\$ _____	\$ _____	87	\$ _____	\$ _____	87	\$ _____	\$ _____	87	\$ _____	\$ _____
6 Visionaire	5	\$ _____	\$ _____	5	\$ _____	\$ _____	5	\$ _____	\$ _____	5	\$ _____	\$ _____
7 TOTAL		\$ _____	\$ _____		\$ _____	\$ _____		\$ _____	\$ _____		\$ _____	\$ _____

SUBMITTALS				SUBMITTALS				SUBMITTALS				SUBMITTALS			
Solicitation, Offer and Award	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Solicitation, Offer and Award	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Solicitation, Offer and Award	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Solicitation, Offer and Award	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
Bid/Offer Response Form	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Bid/Offer Response Form	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Bid/Offer Response Form	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Bid/Offer Response Form	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
Drug Free Workforce Cert.	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Drug Free Workforce Cert.	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Drug Free Workforce Cert.	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Drug Free Workforce Cert.	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
Affidavit of Compliance	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Affidavit of Compliance	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Affidavit of Compliance	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Affidavit of Compliance	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
Statement of No Bid	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Statement of No Bid	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Statement of No Bid	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		Statement of No Bid	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
ADDENDUM NO. 1	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 1	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 1	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 1	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
ADDENDUM NO. 2	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 2	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 2	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 2	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	
ADDENDUM NO. 3	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 3	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 3	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>		ADDENDUM NO. 3	Yes <input type="checkbox"/>	No <input type="checkbox"/>	

Signature: \_\_\_\_\_ Bid Opening Official Date \_\_\_\_\_ Bid Recorder \_\_\_\_\_ Date \_\_\_\_\_